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CITY MANAGERS OFFICE
LAWRENCE, KS -

October 1, 2014

David Corliss
Lawrence City Manager
City Hall

6 East 6th Street
Lawrence, KS 66044

Re:  Rock Chalk Park Certificate of Completion of Infrastructure Improvements and City
Acceptance of Final Completion

Dear Dave:

RCP received the letter of Substantial Completion from the City on September 22, 2014, and
the accompanying punch list. Included in the punch list are the pending change orders and a
few others that will require some additional discussions, particularly since they will have an
impact on the final project cost. I mention this because a couple of the change order items
appear in the Bliss II accounting of their project costs even though they have not been
settled at this time.

We also received the Certificate of Completion of Infrastructure Improvements from Bliss II
the week of September 22, 2014. We have been reviewing the documentation and have
prepared the following comments that we provide to accompany the enclosed
documentation.

In general, Bliss II used the Infrastructure documents and Exhibit I of the Development
Agreement to contract for and track the project costs. In many cases the subcontractor’s
bids were exactly the amount shown on Exhibit I and, in many cases the work was delivered
for that exact cost. The City staff has monitored the construction, and in most cases, has
verified the exact quantities installed. I have not seen the final version of the tracking
document; however, earlier versions indicate that in most cases the actual quantities are
within what RCP would consider a reasonable tolerance of the estimate. That said, I am
sure that there will be some line items where the quantities are above or below the estimate
that will deserve additional discussion.

There are three areas of work where the actual costs were substantially greater than
estimated in Exhibit L.

1. Inthe “General” section, the individual line items varied from the estimates both
positive and negative; however, the final overall costs would have been close to the
original estimate were it not for the difference in the project financing costs that were
nearly $140,000 greater than estimated.
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2. Inthe “Natural Trails and Eight Lighted Tennis Courts” section, there were
significant changes to the design of the tennis courts causing the cost of the courts
and necessary retaining walls to increase by just over $100,000.

3. Inthe “Landscaping” section, the quantities of plants increased by over 200 trees and
1,000 shrubs, and irrigation was added to all of the islands in the parking lots. In
addition, the size of the trees was generally double what was required. The total
increase for the modifications to the landscaping was just over $375,000

We would welcome a discussion regarding these items, the pending change orders and any
other items on the punch list as we work with Bliss II to complete and/or resolve them as we
work toward final completion.

Coydially,

Dale Seuferling
President

DS:clh
Enclosure

ge: Monte Soukup
Harry Wigner



EXHIBIT J
CERTIFICATE OF COMPLETION OF INFRASTRUCTURE IMPROVEMENTS

The undersigned, Bliss Sports II, LLC (“Bliss Sports II”), pursuant to that certain Rock Chalk
Park Development Agreement (the “Development Agreement™) dated July 10, 2013, among the City of
Lawrence, Kansas (“City™), RCP, LLC, Bliss Sports, LC and Bliss Sports IT, hereby certifies to the City

as follows:

1. That as of ’cgt ﬂ , 2014, the construction of the Infrastructure Improvements (as
such term is defined in the Development Agreement) has been completed in accordance with the
Development Agreement and the Infrastructure Improvements Construction Contract.

2, The Infrastructure Improvements have been completed in a good and workmanlike:
manner and in accordance with the Infrastructure Improvements Construction Documents (as defined in

the Development Agrecement).

3. Substantial Completion of the Infrastructure Improvements has occurred,

4, This Centificate of Completion of Infrastructure Improvements is being issued by Bliss
Sports 11 to the City in accordance with the Development Agreement and the Infrastructure Iimprovements

Construction Contract.

5. Attached hercto is a detailed, itemized cost spreadsheet of the total costs for
Infrastructure Improvements and copies of all invoices related thereto,

6. There are no of any laborer’s, materialman’s, mechanic’s or other Liens (“Lien™) on any

part of the Recreation Center Site, or the Infrastructure Improvements and there no conditions exist that
would allow for the filing of a Lien on the Recreation Center Site or the Infrastructure Improvements.

Terms not otherwise defined herein shall have the meaning ascribed to such terms in the
Development Agreement,

IN WIT.I&FSS WHEREQF, the undersigned has here¢unto set his/her hand this i “ day of
BLISS SPORTS I, LLC
L —

By,
Name;




s CITY ACCEPTANCE OF FINAL COMPLETION

The City hereby accepts Final Completion of the Infrastructure Improvements in accordance with
the Infrastructure Improvements Construction Contract in accordance with Section 10.01 of the

"Development Agreement.

Date:
CITY OF LAWRENCE, KANSAS
By:

Title:

N
d A



EXHIBIT1

Rock Chalk Site Work
General Unit Quantity Unit Cost Total Rec Center Site Stadium Slte Final Total
Moaobhilization 5 1 $ 400,00000 5 400,000.00 $§ 12400000 $ 27600000 § 400,000.00
Construction staking s 1 $ 225,000.00 S 225,00000 $ 50,127.00 § 11157300 § 161,700.00
Seeding, muiching & fertilizing AC 20 s 1,50000 $ 30,00000 $ 9,30000 $ 20,700.00 $ 30,000.00
Utilities connection fees/expenses (Black Hills} LS 1 $ 5500000 5 55,000.00 $ - S 39,750.00 $ 39,750.00
Traffic control LS 1 S 5,000.00 5 500000 $ 1,55000 $ 345000 $ 5,000.00
Erosion and sediment control s 1 $ 4000000 S 40,00000 $ 12,40000 $ 27,600.00 $ 40,000.00
Legal fees per Development Agreement 33 1 $ 167,836.00 § 167,836.00 $ 65,886,10 $ 14664571 $  212,53581
Loan origination fees for project financing s 1 $ 150,000.00 % 150,00000 $  49,17956 5 10946419 $§  158,643.75
Loan interest for project financing LS 1 $ 209,515.00 $ 30951500 $ 139,21523 $ 30986626 $§  4495,081.54
Construction management fee 2.5% on $11.5M 13 1 S 287,500.00 S 283,75800 S 87964928 $ 19579302 §  283,758.00
Professional engineering fees 1S 1 $ 52500000 $ 52500000 $ 172,111.60 S 38308730 $§  555,398.70
General Total: $ 2,191,109.00 $ 711,734.52 § 1,62393328 $ 2,335667.80
Site Grading Unit Quantity Unit cost Total Rec Center Site Stadium Site Final Total
Site strip (wy 32,000 § 225 § 72,00000 $ - % - $ -
Site excavation Y 120,000 $ 225 § 405,000.00 $ - s - $ -
Compaction cY 160,000 3 110 § 176,00000 $ - % - § -
Topsoll replacement/fine grade cY 10,000 $ 10.00 % 100,000.00 $ - S - $ -
Rock excavation cY 9750 § 1000 5 9750000 S - 5 - $ -
Site Grading Total: § 850,500.00 $ 26365500 $ 58684500 $§  850,500.00
Retention Ponds Unit Quantity Unit cost Total RecCenter Site Stadium Site Final Total
Rock excavation cY 10000 § 1000 $ 100,000.00 $ - 3 - 3 -
Dirt excavation Y 5000 $ 225 & 11,25000 S -5 - & -
Faircloth skimmers LS 3 $ 1000000 % 30,0000 $ - 8 - § -
Storm structure s 3 s 500000 3% 15,00000 $ - $ - -] -
Site Grading Total: " $ 156,250.00 $ 48,437.50 $ 10781250 S 156,250.00
Natural Tralts and Eight Lighted Tennis Courts Unit Quantity Unit cost Total Rec Cervter Site Stadium Site Final Total
Tennls courts 5 1 $ 64000000 S 640,000.00 $ 917,165.00 $ - $ 917,165.00
Retaining walls at tennis courts 15 1 $ 170,00000 $ 170,000.00 $ - $ - 5 -
Natural trad sY 33,710 $ 1200 $ . 40452000 5 401,80500 § - $ 401,805.00
'+ Eight Lighted Tennis Courts: - $  :1,214,520.00 $ 1,318970.00 $ - $ 1,318,970.00



EXHIBIT 1

Rock Chalk Site Work PAGE 2

Waterline Unit Quantity Unit Cost Total Rec Center Site Stadium Site Final Total
Connect to existing water line 1 1 S 75¢.00 5 75000 S - $ - $ -
12" CS00 DR14 water line LF 7642 § 3687 3% 281,760.54 - 8 -3 -
8" PVC C900 DR14 water iine LF 472§ 2900 $ 13,688.00 $ - 8 - § -
3" MLL. gate vaive EACH 2 $ 50000 $ 1,000.00 $ - $ - 8 -
6" M. gate valve EACH 2 $ 82500 $§ 1,650.00 § - % - 8 -
8" M.J. gate valve EACH 2 $ 130000 $ 2,60000 $ - 3 - % .
12" MLL. gate valve EACH EE] $ 150000 $ 4950000 $ - 8 - % -
Fire hydrant assembly EACH 17 $ 330000 $ 56,100.00 $ - 8 - % -
Private fire hydrant assembly {painted red) EACH 2 $ 330000 $ 6,600.00 $ - 3 - % -
Flowabie fil} 5 1 $ 2691000 $ 26,910.00 $ - 8 - § -
2" curb stop with auto flusher and rip rap LS 1 $ 600000 $ 6,000.00 $ - $ - $ -
Water meter pits s 1 $ 2030311 $ 20,303.11 $ - % - § .
Concrete encasement LE 20 $ 6000 $ 1,200.00 § - $ - $ -

Waterline Total: $ 468,061.65 $ 163,821.70 $ 30424030 $  468,062.00

Sanitary Sewer Unit CQuantity Unit Cost Total Rec Center Site Stadium Site Final Total
8" SDR26 PVC granular embedment iF 2018 § 4400 $ 88,836.00 $ - $ - 8 -
STD manhole 4" DIA, §' depth EACH g $ 200000 $ 16,000.00 $ - 5 - & -
Extra depth 4’ DIA manhole VE 1246 S 10000 5 1,246.00 § - 3 - $ -
Drop manhale 5' DIA &' depth EACH 1 $ 297000 S 2,570.00 $ - % - 3 -
Extra depth 5' DIA manhole VF 6.3 s 11000 $ 693.00 $ - 8 - % -
&" service line EACH 4 8 500.00 $ 2,00000 % - 8 - % -
Connect to existing manhale EACH 1 8 50000 $ 50000 $ - % - $ -
Concrate collars EACH 7 s 57000 $ 3,990.00 $ - % - $ -
Flowable mortar backiil Y w03 % 7000 $ 2821000 $ - 0§ - $ -
Seed, fertilize, mulch and erosion netting LS 1 $ 550000 3 5,500,000 % - 8 - 3 -

Construction staking no bid no bid

Rip rap erosion protection 18 1 § 250000 3 2,500.00 5 - 5 - % -
Concrate encasement 12 a5 $ 5000 $ 2,250.00 $ - § - 3 -
Impervious ditch check s 1 5 75000 $ 75000 % - % - % -
Polyurethane manhole Hning Is 1 $ 739750 § 7,39750 § - § - § -

Sanitary Sewer Total: $ 162,842.50 $§ SO4BLI7 § 11236133 §  162,842.50

Storm Sewer Unit Quantity Unit Cost Total Rec Center Site Stadium Site Final Total
15" HOPE LE 38 $ 2375 3 90250 % - 3 - % -
15" reinforced cancrete pipe LF 79 $ 2475 S 195525 $ - % - 8 -
18" HOPE WF &7 ] 2400 $ 2,08300 $ - 8 - $ -
18" reinforced concrete pipe LF 76 s 2500 % 1,900.00 $ - 3 - % -
24" HOPE , LF 706§ 3000 $ 21,18000 $ - .5 - % -
. 24" reinforced concrete’ pipe . . LF 33 $ 3200 $ 1,216,00 § - 5 - 3 -



EXHIBIT1

Rack Chalk Site Work PAGE 3
Storm Sewer, Cont'd: Unit  Quantity Unit Cost Total Rec Center Site Stadium Site Final Total
30" HDPE L 19 % 3900 $ 74100 § - 5 - % -
48" reinforced concrete pipe LF 103 $ 105.00 3% 10,8315.00 $ - S - 5 -
15" RCP end section EACH 1 $ 45000 3 45000 % - 8 - S5 -
30" RCP end section EACH 1 5 45000 $ 450.00 $ - 3 - $ -
48" RCP end section EACH 2 S 190000 $ 3,800.00 $ - 8 - $ -
S'x4' curs infet EACH 6 $ 202500 $ 12,15000 $ - 5 - 3 -
10'%4' curb inlet EACH 3 $ 325200 § 9,756.00 § - 5 - % -
4'x4' junction box EACH 1 $ 218500 § 2,185.00 $ - - 3 -
18"NOM DiA rip rap sy 84 3 2500 $ 2,100.00 $ - $ - § -
Flowable fili s 1 $ 13,00000 S 1100000 $ - & - 5 -
Storm Sewer Total § 8268875 $ 4134437 $ 41344338 $  B2,6887S
Parking Lot Lights Unit  Quantity Unit Cost Total  Rec Center Site Stadium Site Final Total
LED - dual fixtures LS i $ 120,000.00 % 12000000 $§ 116000.00 $ 11600000 $  232,000.00
Pole bases s i $ 2500000 $ 25,00000 S - $ - § -
Conduit ts i $  40,00000 S 40,000.00 S - § - 5 -
Conduit - Westar s 1 $ 2500000 S 2500000 5 - 85 - $ -
Electric service - labor s 1 $ 3000000 $ 30,000.00 $ - % - $ -
Parking Lot Lights Total: $ 24000000 $ 116000.00 $ 11600000 $  232,000.00
Landscaping Unit  Quantity Unit Cost Total RecCenterSite  Stadiumn Site Final Total
Trees EACH 450 $ 42500 S 191,250.00 $ 13181200 $ 29338800 $ 42520000
Shrubs EACH Mo § 60.00 $ 4260000 $ 2123965 $ 4127535 $ 68,515.00
Site entry signs s 1 $ 150,00000 $ 150,000.00 $ - § 5320000 $ 53,200.00
Irvigation s 1 $ 100,000.00 § 100,00000 $ 7831226 $ 17430794 $  252,620.20
LS 1 $ 100,000.00 3 10000000 S 4543880 $ 11004120 $  155,480.00
Landscaping Total: $ 583,850.00 $ 280,802.71 $ 67821249 $  959,015.20
Rock Chatk Drive & George Williams Way Unit Quantity Unit Cost Total Rec Center Site Stadivm Site Final Total
Unclassified excavation n 15934 & 500 $ 79,670.00 $ - % - $ -
Compacted fill cY 1790 $ 100 $ 1,790.00 $ - 8 -~ § -
Site restoration s i $ 500000 $ 500000 % - § - § -
10" NRD) Portland cement conc pave sY 9758 S 5500 $ 536,600.00 $ - % - $ -
Type CG-1 conarete curb and gutter LF 6257 1600 $ 100,112.00 $ - 8 - 5 -
4" x 5' concrete sidewalk sY 40 $ 3000 S 1,200.00 $ - 8 - § -
6" x 10" fiber reinforced concrete sidewalk sY 4078 § 4000 $ 163,120.00 $ - $ - % -
Agccess ramps EACH 13 $ 100000 S 13,000.00 S - s - $ -
Compaction tests street : LS 5 5 100.0¢ % 500.00 $ - 8 - $ -



EXHIBIT 1

Rock Chalk Site Work PAGE 4
Rock Chalk Drive & George Williams Way Cont'd: Unit Quantity Unit Cost Total Rec Center Site Stadium Site Final Total
Construction staking No 8id Na Bid No Bid No Bid

Seed, fertilize and mulch LS 1 $ 400000 5 4,000.00 3 - % - 3 -
Clearing, grubbing and tree removal s 1 $ 125000 3 1,25000 $ -3 - $ -
Treatment of subgrade 12" fly ash & 4"AR3 14 11,825 § 933 3§ 10327.35 § - $ - 8 -
Erosion control 13 i $ 267000 $ 267000 $ - $ - % -
Section corner monument box s 1 5 1,00000 $ 1,00000 % -8 - % -
2" conduit LF L7201 200 $ 3402.00 $ - $ - % -
4" conduit LF 997 $ 200 3 1,99400 $ - 3§ - 8 -
Traffic control signage LS 1 $ 500.00 $ 500.00 3 - 3 - 3 -

Rack Chalk Drive & George Williams Total: § 1,026,225.25 $ 1,026,225.25 $ 1,026,225.25

Overflow Parking Lot Unit Quantity Unit Cost Total Rec Center Site Stadium Site Final Total
Concrete access Famps sY 464 $ 5000 % 2320000 $ - $ - § -
Lot grading s 1 $ 2500000 $ 2500000 $ - % - § -
Ternporary gravel laydown s 1 $ 2000000 $ 20,000.00 5 - $ - § -

Overflow Parking Lot Total: $ 68,200.00 S - $ 6820000 35 68,200.00

Parking tot / Access Drives Unit  Quantity Unit Cost Total Rec Center Site Stadiym Site Final Total
Concrete parking lot SY 44356  § 4400 5  1,951,66400 $ - 8 - 8 -
CG-1 curh and gutter LF 15338 $ 18.00 $ 276,084.00 % - 3 - % -
Concrete parking and bus lane sY 7337 % 5000 $ 366,850.00 $ - 5 - % -
Fire jane / access roads sY 8593 3§ 4400 § 378,092.00 $ -8 - 8 -
Storm sewer s 1 $ 157,000.00 $ 157,00000 $ - 3 - $ -
Teim subgrade sY 65393 $ 125 $ 8174125 § - $ - $ -
Treatment of subgrade - 12"Fly ash & 4" AB3 sY 65425 § 933 § 610,415.25 $ - 5 - $ -

Parking Lot / Access Drives Total: §  3,821,846.50 $ 1,816,400.25 $ 200584625 $ 3,821,296.50

Rock Chalk Lane and Rock Chalk Parkway Unit Quantity Unit Cost Totai Rec Center Site Stadium Site Final Total
Unclassified excavation oY 3017 § 500 $ 15,085.00 $ -8 - $ -
Compacted fill oY 2920 § 100 $ 292000 $ -8 -8 -
Site restoration s 1 $§ 500000 $ 500000 $ - % - 8 -
2" NRDJ Portland cement sY 9524 & 5000 $ 476,200.00 $ -5 - % -
€G-1 curb and gutter WF 5109 § 1600 $ 8174400 $ - 8 - % -
6" x 10" fiber rec path sy 5163 4000 $ 206,520.00 $ -3 - % -
4" x &' sidewalk sY 195 $ 3000 § 5,850.00 $ - 8 - § -
Access ramps EACH 51 $ 100000 $ 51,000.00 $ -8 - % -
Treatment of subgrade - 12" fiy ash & 4"AB3 sY 10,800 5 933 3 100,764.00 $ - 8 -8 -

Rock Chatk Lane and Rock Chatk Parkway Total: §. 945,083.00

W
]

$§ 94508300 § 345083.00



Chip and Seal County Road
Chip and seal

Rec Center Pad
Rock excavation
Dirt excavation
Compaction
Fly ash 18"
ARB3 entire builkding pad
AB3 additional depth rock area
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EXHIBIT1

Rock Chalk Site Work PAGE 5
CQuantity Unit Cost Total Rec Center Site Stadium Site Final Total
10,000 % 180 S 18,000.00 % - 5 2608500 $ 26,085.00
Chip and Seal County Road § 18,006.00 $ - $  26,085.00 26,085.00
Quantity Unit cost Total Rec Center Site Stadium Site Final Total
18,000 $ 1000 3 180,000.00 $ -8 - % -
10,000 $ 2235 § 2250000 $ -8 - § .
8500 & 110 § 9,350.00 $ - % - 8 -
12,000 & 800 $ 96,000.00 $ - 8 - $ -
20100 § 400 §$ 80,400.00 $ - 8§ - 8 .
go00  § 550 % 44,000.00 $ - & - $ -
Rec Center Pad: § 432,250.00 $ 432,250.00 § - $ 43225000
Quantity Unit cost Total Rec Center Site Stadium Site Final Total
1 $ - $ - % 5088900 & 23211213 $  263,00L13
a $ - $ - % 11076500 $§ 11076500 $  221,530.00
Change Orders: $ - $ 16165400 $ 342877213 $  504,531.13
Total: § 12,261,426.65
Rec Center Site |  Stadium Site Final Total
Final Total: $ 6,270,122.47 { § 6,615,563.53 | $ 12,885,685.00
Rec Center Site Stadium Site Fnal Total
Change Orders: $ 16165400 |5 342877935 50453113




